
 

  Authorized Signature

                  03/24/2016  
  

Texas Dept of Motor Vehicles
Purchase Order # 60800 0000002264

Page: 1 of  2

Payment Terms: NET30 Freight Terms:  PREPAY 
AND ADD
  

Ship Via:VNDR PCC: E Date: 02/23/16 PO Method: DG Dispatch: Dispatch 
Via Email

Rev Dt:

 PLEASE NOTE:  ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS ARE LISTED AT THE END OF THE PURCHASE ORDER. 

Vendor:    

 

ULINE
2200 S LAKESIDE DR
WAUKEGAN IL 600858361
United States

Ship To: 1P08  
1925 E. Beltline, Ste. 100
Carrollton TX 75006
United States

Vendor ID:   1363342142 

Purchaser:
Phone: 
Fax: 
Email: 

Jeffrey S Kushaney
512/465-4181
512/465-5641
Jeff.Kushaney@txdmv.gov

Bill To:          4000 Jackson Avenue
Austin TX 78731
United States

Fax:       
Email: DMV_FIN-INVOICES@TxDMV.gov

PO Information:

Payment: 
Payment will be made in accordance with the Texas Prompt Payment Act, TGC, Subtitle F, Chapter 2251. Vendor shall submit one copy of a correct 
itemized invoice showing the purchase order number, payee ID., remit to address, and phone number on invoice. Vendors may submit an electronic 
invoice. All electronic invoices shall be sent to DMV_FIN-INVOICES@txdmv.gov (note: There is an underscore "_" between DMV and FIN). All 
invoices received at the email address will be filed for future reference and you will receive a receipt confirmation email. To avoid the confusion of 
duplicate invoices, please do not send other copies of this invoice via regular mail, fax or other means. On emails for electronic invoices, include the 
company name (as it appears on the invoice) and the purchase order number in the subject line to assist in identifying and processing your invoices 
in a timely manner. TxDMV will not incur any penalty for late payment if payment is made in 30 days or less from receipt of goods or services and a 
correct invoice, which-ever is later. 

Note: warrants will not be issued to a vendor without a current Texas Identification Number.

Line-Sch Line Description Class/Item Quantity UOM Unit Price Extended Amt Due Date

1- 1 Table, Packaging, Jumbo, 72 
in X 48 in, 1-5/8 in Laminate 
Top, 500 Lb. Capacity, 
Adjustable Steel Legs Model  
#H-4988
*Price includes inside 
delivery and shipping

425/20 1.0000 EA 543.48000 543.48 02/23/2016 
 

Schedule Total 543.48

ReqID: 
0000002450

Customer #11001685
Order #79829949

  

Item Total for Line # 1 543.48  



 

  Authorized Signature

                  03/24/2016  
  

Texas Dept of Motor Vehicles
Purchase Order # 60800 0000002264

Page: 2 of  2

Total PO Amount 543.48
   

All Shipments, Shipping papers, invoices and correspondence must be identified with our Purchase Order Number.  Overshipments will not be accepted 
unless authorized by Buyer prior to Shipment.

Terms and Conditions: 

Texas Department of Motor Vehicles Standard Terms and Conditions can be found at:  http://www.txdmv.gov/contractors-vendors

 
 

 



From: Slaughter, Renee
To: Kushaney, Jeff
Subject: RE: Surplus Packing Table?
Date: Monday, March 14, 2016 10:35:31 AM
Attachments: image003.png

Gotcha.
All I have are regular desks and if they are all the standard height, I unfortunately do not have
 something to help them out on this request.
Sorry.
 
 
 

Renee Slaughter
Inventory Control/Allocations Specialist
 
Finance & Administrative Services Division
Texas Department of Motor Vehicles
4000 Jackson Avenue
Austin  TX 78731
(p) 512.465.4092
(f) 512.467.3959
 
Tell us how we’re doing. Complete our customer satisfaction survey
 
 

From: Kushaney, Jeff 
Sent: Monday, March 14, 2016 9:31 AM
To: Slaughter, Renee <Renee.Slaughter@txdmv.gov>
Subject: RE: Surplus Packing Table?
 
No, but it does need to be that height (35”) and size.  It will be for closing out at the end of each day
 and everyone will be standing around it which is why it needs to be that height and size.  A desk is only
 30” high and everyone will be banging their knees and shins into it.
 
I hope that helps!
 
 

Jeff Kushaney || Purchaser
Finance and Administrative Services Division
Tell us how we’re doing. Complete our customer satisfaction survey
E: Jeff.Kushaney@TxDMV.gov    O: 512.465.4181   F: 512.465.5641

4000 Jackson Ave || Austin TX 78731 || www.TxDMV.gov

mailto:/O=EXCHANGELABS/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=5EE6485AAF3046A8929016783B94523A-RENEE.SLAUG
mailto:Jeff.Kushaney@txdmv.gov
https://www.surveymonkey.com/s/FAS2015survey
https://www.surveymonkey.com/s/FAS2015survey
mailto:Jeff.Kushaney@TxDMV.gov
http://www.txdmv.gov/
http://www.txdmv.gov/

Jumbo Packing Table - 72 x 48", Laminate Top

Huge workspace. Work from both sides in
shipping depariments and assembly areas.

—_—TT

15/8" thick laminate fop with rounded comers.

Al tables hold up fo 500 Ibs.

Adjustable steel legs 28 0 35" in 11/2"
increments.

Fulkdepth bottom shelf for storage.
Replacement Tops available.






 
 

From: Slaughter, Renee 
Sent: Monday, March 14, 2016 9:08 AM
To: Kushaney, Jeff
Subject: FW: Surplus Packing Table?
 
Good morning.
 
Does it have to be able to hold 500 pounds?
We may have some desks that could possibly fill this request unless it has to hold a lot of weight.
 
Please advise.
 
 

Renee Slaughter
Inventory Control/Allocations Specialist
 
Finance & Administrative Services Division
Texas Department of Motor Vehicles
4000 Jackson Avenue
Austin  TX 78731
(p) 512.465.4092
(f) 512.467.3959
 
Tell us how we’re doing. Complete our customer satisfaction survey
 
 

From: Zz - Resource - DMV_Property 
Sent: Monday, March 14, 2016 9:05 AM
To: Slaughter, Renee <Renee.Slaughter@txdmv.gov>
Subject: FW: Surplus Packing Table?
 
Please assist Jeff in seeing if we may have something comparable to what he is asking. Thank you.
 

From: Kushaney, Jeff 
Sent: Friday, March 11, 2016 12:50 PM
To: Zz - Resource - DMV_Property <DMV_Property@txdmv.gov>
Subject: Surplus Packing Table?

http://www.twostepsonesticker.com/
https://www.surveymonkey.com/s/FAS2015survey
mailto:Renee.Slaughter@txdmv.gov
mailto:DMV_Property@txdmv.gov


 
Does surplus have anything like this for the Dallas Region?  This is what they are requesting.  Thanks!
 

 

Jeff Kushaney || Purchaser
Finance and Administrative Services Division
Tell us how we’re doing. Complete our customer satisfaction survey
E: Jeff.Kushaney@TxDMV.gov    O: 512.465.4181   F: 512.465.5641

4000 Jackson Ave || Austin TX 78731 || www.TxDMV.gov

 
 

https://www.surveymonkey.com/s/FAS2015survey
mailto:Jeff.Kushaney@TxDMV.gov
http://www.txdmv.gov/
http://www.txdmv.gov/
http://www.twostepsonesticker.com/






From: Customer.Service@ULINE.COM
To: Kushaney, Jeff
Subject: ULINE Confirmation - Order#: 0079829949
Date: Thursday, March 24, 2016 12:06:39 PM

Thank you for your order!                                                 

Here is your Uline order confirmation:                                    

---------------------------------------------------------------------------
Order#:     0079829949                 Order Date: 03/24/2016             
Customer:     10323284                 Will Ship:  03/24/2016             
Purch Order:  2264                     Ship Via:   Motor Freight - BFS    
---------------------------------------------------------------------------

Sold To:                               Ship To:                           

TEXAS STATE OF                         TXDMV DALLAS RSC                   
JEFF KUSHANEY/PURCHASING                                                  
MOTOR VEHICLES DEPT                    1925 E BELT LINE RD STE 100        
4000 JACKSON AVE                       ATTN MARK RANDALL                  
AUSTIN, TX  78731                      CARROLLTON, TX  75006              

---------------------------------------------------------------------------
     Qty   UM   Item#         Description               Price     Total   
---------------------------------------------------------------------------
      1 KT H-4988-LAM    72X48" LAMINATE JUMBO PKG    $480.00      $480.00
      1 PK H-2650        ULINE 2-PACK DISPENSER CO      $0.00        $0.00

                                                    Sub-Total      $480.00
                                            Shipping/Handling       $63.48
                                                    Sales Tax        $0.00
                                                        Total      $543.48
---------------------------------------------------------------------------

Track your Order Status in the My Uline Account section                   
https://www.uline.com/MyAccount/TrackOrders.aspx                          

Please contact us if you have any questions.                              
                                                                          
                                                                          
                                                                          
Uline Customer Service                                                    
(800) 295-5510                                                            
customer.service@uline.com                                                

mailto:Customer.Service@ULINE.COM
mailto:Jeff.Kushaney@txdmv.gov
https://www.uline.com/MyAccount/TrackOrders.aspx
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