A Texas Dept of Motor Vehicles Page: 1 of 2

A g
ﬁ Pur chase Order # 60800 0000002169
Texas Department
of Motor Vehicles
Payment Terms: NET30 Freight Terms. FOB Ship Via VNDR PCC: E Date: 01/27/16 PO Method: DG Dispatch: Dispatch Rev Dt:
Destination Via Email

PLEASE NOTE: ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS ARE LISTED AT THE END OF THE PURCHASE ORDER.

Vendor: RODZINA INDUSTRIESINC Ship To: 1P01
3518 FENTON RD 4210 N. Clack
FLINT M1 485071567 Abilene TX 79601
United States United States

Vendor ID: 1382471219

Purchaser: Jeffrey S Kushaney Bill To: 4000 Jackson Avenue
Phone: 512/465-4181 Austin TX 78731
Fax: 512/465-5641 United States
Email: Jeff.Kushaney @txdmv.gov
Fax:
Email: DMV _FIN-INVOICES@TxDMV .gov
| Line-Sch  LineDescription Clasg/ltem Quantity UOM Unit Price Extended Amt Due Date
1-1 Date Stamper, Self-Inking, 615/77 1.0000 EA 18.90000 18.90 02/26/2016
Black Ink, "CCQO", Trodat
Model 5430
61577753009 - Stamper
($17.00)
61577871082 - Die Charges
($1.90)
Schedule Total | 18.90 |
ReqglD:
0000002351
Stamper to read:
CCO
date
Abilene RSC
E-mail quote dated 1/8/2016.
Item Total for Line#1 | 18.90 |
Total PO Amount 18.90

All Shipments, Shipping papers, invoices and correspondence must be identified with our Purchase Order Number. Overshipments will not be accepted
unless authorized by Buyer prior to Shipment.

Authorized Signature
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W l% / 01/27/2016
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Termsand Conditions:

Texas Department of Mator Vehicles Standard Terms and Conditions can be found at: http://www.txdmv.gov/contractors-vendors

Authorized Signature
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Kushaney, Jeff

From: rodzinaind@aol.com

Sent: Friday, January 08, 2016 8:27 AM
To: Kushaney, Jeff

Subject: Re: Quote Needed

Good morning,

(20) 61577861000 stamps - 4.20 ea.
(20) 61577871041 die charges - 1.90 ea.

(20) 61577753009 daters - 17.00 ea.
(20) 61577871082 die charges - 2.10 ea.

(20) 61577753009 daters - 17.00 ea.
(20) 61577871041 die charges - 1.90 ea.

Robert Cross

From: Kushaney, Jeff <Jeff. Kushaney@txdmv.gov>
To: 'rodzinaind@aol.com' <rodzinaind@aol.com>
Sent: Fri, Jan 8, 2016 9:12 am

Subject: Quote Needed

Good morning and Happy New Year Robert! Can you please provide a quote for the attached stamps? Thanks!

Jeff Kushaney || Purchaser
Finance and Administrative Services Division

Tell us how we're doing. Complete our customer satisfaction survey

E: Jeff Kushaney@TxDMV.gov  O:512.465.4181 F: 512.465.5641

gg’( Texas Department of Motor Vehicles

HELPING TEXANS GO, HELPING TEXAS GROW.

4000 Jackson Ave || Austin TX 78731 || www.TxDMV.gov

WO STEPS i bl
¢ NE Inspection & Registration - Together at Last!
¥ STICKER | Visit www.TwoStepsOneSticker.com to learn more!
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